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LET’S TALK ABOUT IT! 
Video Series

Amy: I live in North-West London and what I like about where I live are the green spaces and the parks, 
where you can play lots of sports.

Katie: I live in a suburb, in North London, and the thing I don’t like about it is that all the houses look 
the same.

Matthew: I live in a small town south of London. I really like the fact that it’s peaceful, quiet, tranquil; 
however, it can get a little bit boring sometimes.

Cameron: I live in a small town called Woking in the south of England. I like it because, although it’s a 
small town, there’s a lot to do.

Simon: The most beautiful place I’ve ever been would be in Perú, a place called Machu Picchu. It’s an 
old temple up a mountain. It’s a very ancient, historic site, very important to the local community, very 
picturesque, very quiet place, and the views are spectacular.

Becky: The most beautiful place I have ever been is Victoria Falls, in Africa. The area around it is green 
and unspoilt, and the waterfalls themselves are truly magnificent. The most amazing thing about Victoria 
Falls is the size of the waterfall, the sound and the spray that comes off the water.

Kathryn: The most beautiful place I’ve ever been is the Lake District because it has such a wide variety 
of landscapes. In the Lake District, there are lakes, there are rolling green hills, and there are areas of 
mountains that look like the moon.

Katie: The most beautiful place I’ve been is Venice. The buildings are very old and historic.

Amy: The most beautiful place I’ve been to is a stunning, quiet, little forest in Arés, near Bordeaux, in 
France, and I cycled through it, so it’s really secret and unspoilt and just a really beautiful landscape.

Cameron: The most beautiful country I’ve ever been to is the Philippines. It’s a hot, tropical country and 
the landscape is stunning.

Matthew: The most exotic place I’ve been is Jamaica. It’s full of interesting people and is a really 
colourful country.

Simon: The place in the world that I don’t like would be London, which is strange because I live here, but 
I don’t like London because it’s so noisy and crowded and nobody knows each other; it’s quite anonymous 
here. I prefer the countryside which is a bit more quiet and peaceful and everybody knows each other.

Katie: I went to Hong Kong and I didn’t like it because there’s lots of people and the buildings make you 
feel very claustrophobic, and it’s hot and humid.

Matthew: I went to Poland once and I didn’t like it very much. The weather was cold, wet, windy.

Cameron: I don’t like big cities because I don’t like crowded places. I much prefer the countryside 
because it’s quiet and peaceful.

Amy: I’d love to travel to Indonesia and South-East Asia because it seems like a completely different 
culture to Europe.
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Katie: I’d really love to travel to Hawaii because I think it’s got the most beautiful beaches, and it seems 
like a really magical place.

Cameron: I’d love to travel to India because the culture seems fascinating, and the people also seem 
friendly and welcoming.

Matthew: I’d love to travel to New Zealand someday. Seems like a fascinating country with amazing 
natural beauty.

Simon: I would ideally like to live somewhere rural with the ocean nearby, but here in Britain probably, 
somewhere like Somerset or Devon.


